TOWN OF DAVIE
TOWN COUNCIL AGENDA REPORT

TO: Mayor and Council Members
FROM/PHONE: Bill Underwood/797-1050

DOCUMENT PREPARED BY: Bill Underwood/797-1050
SUBJECT: Resolution

AFFECTED DISTRICT: Town Wide

TITLE OF AGENDA ITEM:
A RESOLUTION OF THE TOWN OF DAVIE, FLORIDA
CONCERNING THE HOLLYWOOD/FORT LAUDERDALE
AJRPORT EXPANSION; ESTABLISHING EXPENSES FOR
THE PROPOSED AIRPORT EXPANSION; PROVIDING THE
TOWN TO PAY FOR 1/3 OF THE EXPENSES UP TO THE
AMOUNT OF $20,000 TO BE SHARED ALONG WITH
THE CITY OF HOLLYWOOD AND THE CITY OF DANIA
BEACH.

REPORT IN BRIEF: Atan August 26, 2002 meeting of the Town Council, the Council agreed to share costs
with the City of Dania Beach and Hollywood on issues relative to the expansion of the Ft.
Lauderdale/Hollywood Airport. Since this meeting, The Town has submitted its share ($17,161.21) of
expenses to the City of Dania Beach.

The City of Dania Beach is seeking additional cost sharing reimbursement in the amount of $11,792.88 for the
period June, 2003 to June, 2004.

The attached resolution authorizes an additional expenditure amount not to exceed $20,000 to be charged to
the Town Administrator’s department, after expending the aforementioned amount the balance will be
$8,207.12.

PREVIOUS ACTIONS: August 26, 2002 meeting minutes
CONCURRENCES:

FISCAL IMPACT:
Has request been budgeted?
If yes, expected cost:

Additional Comments: $20,000 from Town Administrators Special Projects Account.
RECOMMENDATION(S): Motion to approve the resolution.

Attachment(s): Various reimbursement requests from the City of Dania Beach.
Resolution



RESOLUTION

A RESOLUTION OF THE TOWN OF DAVIE, FLORIDA
CONCERNING THE HOLLYWOOD/FORT LAUDERDALE
AIRPORT EXPANSION; ESTABLISHING EXPENSES FOR
THE PROPOSED AIRPORT EXPANSION; PROVIDING THE
TOWN TO PAY FOR 1/3 OF THE EXPENSES UP TO THE
AMOUNT OF $25,000 TO BE SHARED ALONG WITH

THE CITY OF HOLLYWOOD AND THE CITY OF DANIA
BEACH.

WHEREAS, the Town agreed to pay one third of the cost to address various issues to update the
socioeconomic study, and environmental impact study that would be incurred by the Town, the City of
Hollywood, and the City of Dania Beach.

WHEREAS, The Town would need to contribute funds toward the legal costs that would be incurred
by the Town, the City of Hollywood, and the City of Dania Beach.

WHEREAS, The Town has contributed seventeen thousand one hundred sixty dollars and twenty-
one cents.

WHEREAS, the expansion of the Hollywood/Fort Lauderdale Airport will result in an increase in the
amount of air traffic currently traveling over the Town; and

WHEREAS, the availability of funds for considering the effects of Hollywood/Fort Lauderdale
Airport Expansion on the Town will be a benefit to the general public.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF DAVIE,
FLORIDA:

SECTION 1. The Town will remit cost sharing payment to the City of Dania Beach up to an
additional twenty thousand dollars.

SECTION 2. Funding will be provided within the Town Administrator’s department.

SECTION 3.  That this Resolution shall take effect immediately upon its passage and approval.

PASSED AND ADOPTED THIS DAY OF ,2004.
MAYOR/COUNCILMEMBERS

Attest:

Town Clerk

APPROVED THIS DAY OF ,2002.




September 8, 2003

Mr. Ken Cohen
Assistant City Manager
Town of Davie

6591 Orange Drive
Davie, FL 33314-3399

RE: Airport Expansion Related Attorney Fees

Dear Mr. Cohen:

Enclosed are copies of three invoices from White and Case for services related to the
airport expansion issue for May, June and July, 2003. Please review the invoices and

remit the Town of Davie's share to the City of Dania Beach. It is my understanding that
you have agreed to be responsible for one-third of the total cost.

Should you need further information, please do not hesitate to contact me at (954) 924-
3620.

Sincerely yours,

Patricia Varney
Director of Finance

Copy: Ivan Pato
City Manager
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\9\“ WHITE 5 CASE

LIMITED LIADILITY PARTNERSHIFP

FIiRsST UNION FINANCIAL CENTER
200 SCOUTH BisCAYNE BOULEVARD, SUITE 4900
Miami, FLORIDA 33131-2352

The City of Dania Beach August 13, 2003
Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro INVOICE NQ. 666566
3107 Stirling Road

Suite 300

FEDERAL IDENTIFICATION MUMBER 1 35805070

Ft. Lauderdale, FL, 33312

re EIS CONSULTATION @6

Ref. No. 1504197-0002 e

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in
cocnnection with the above-referenced matter SEP 9 g
for the pericd ending July 31, 2003
as follows:

07/03/03 Telephone conversation with T MCALILEY 1.00
Lorie Mertens; review
interleccal agreements;
telephone conversation with
Tom Ansbro.

07/14/03 Telephone conversation with T MCALILEY .80
Dan Abbott (City of
Hollywood) ; legal reseaxrch
regarding proper defendants
in NEPA action.

07/17/03 Legal research regarding T MCALILEY .10
recent case blocking airport
on NEPA grounds.

07/29/03 Telephone conversation with T MCALILEY .10
Tom Ansbro regarding new
amendment to DRI statute.

07/31/03 Legal research regarding T MCALILEY 1.00
recent Florida legislation
regarding airport; draft
statement about effect of
legislation on interlocal
agreement; telephone
conversations with Tom
Ansbro.



WHITE & CASE
LIMITED LIABILITY PARTNERSHIP
FirsT UNMION FINANCIAL CENTER
200 SouTH BISCAYNE BOULEVARD, SUITE 4900
Miam1, FLORIDA 33131-2352

(he City of Dania Beach July 15, 2003
ittn: Thomas J. Ansbro INVOICE NO. 663391
ef. Neo., 1504197-0002 Page 3

FEOEMAL IDENTIFICATION NUMBER 13 3803074

TIME SUMMARY
TIMEKEEPER TITLE HOURS

4291 THOMAS MCALILEY Level 2 1.10
TOTALS 1.10



i (WED) & 6'03 10:01/5T. 10:00-NC, 4800000122 P 2
FROW . /1/t

l WHITE & CASE
LIMITED LIABILITY PARTNERSHIP
FIRST UNION FINANCIAL CENTER
200 SOUTH BISCAYNE BOULEVARD, SUITE 4900
MiAM), FLORIDA 33131-2352

The City of Dania Beach June 9, 2003
Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro INVOICE NO. 65845%
3107 Stirling Road

Suite 300

Ft. Lauderdals:, FL, 33312

FEDERAL 'DENTIFICATION HUMBER |3-aeckero

Ra2f. No. 1504197-0002

FCR PROFESSIONAIL SERVICES RENDERED in
connection with the above-referenced matter
for the period ending May 31, 2003
as follows:

05/08/03 Telephone conversation with T MCALILEY .10
Tom Anabrc.

05/09/03 Organize research files. A MORALES .10

05/17/03 Qutline iasues for T MCALILEY 1.40

engagement with FAA/County
regarding next draft EIS.

05/19/03 Telephone ~all to Brenda T MCALILEY .10
Chalifour.
05/20/03 Telephone zonversation with T MCALILEY .80

Dan Abbott (City of
Hollywood) regarding
privilege ilgsues and
litigation issues related to
EIS; teleplicne conversation
with Brenda Chalifour.

05/30/03 Review materials regarding T MCALILEY .60
' Broward County EIS procegs.
eNT
@)
TOTAL PFOFESSIONAL FEEg  APPTY 3 1,010.00

COSTS A¥D DISBURSEMENTS

00l 14 0210 53 BIS
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" The City of Dania Beach
Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro
Ref. No. 1504197-0002

(WED) 8. &6 03 10:01/8T. 10:00/NC. 4B00000122 P 3

WHITE & CASE
LIMITED LIABILITY FARTHNERIHIP
FIRST UNION FiNANCIAL CENTER
200 SOUTH BISCAYNE BouLevarD, SUITE 4g00
MIAMI, FLORIDA 33131-2382

June 9, 2003

INVOICE NO.
Page 2

Photoccpying

TOTAL COsTE

TOTAL

AND DISBURSEMENTS S

FEDERAL IDENTIFIGATION LI

658455

DEA (I-HA0BOTA

= - § 5



WHITE & CASE

LIMITED LIABILITY PARTHNERSHIP

FirsT UNION FINANCIAL CENTER
200 SQUTH BISCAYNE BOULEVARD, SUITE 4900
MiaMI, FLORIDA 33131-2352

The City of Dania Beach
Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro
Ref. No. 1504187-0002

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES

COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS

Photocopying
Telephone

TOTAL COSTS AND DISRBURSEMENTS

TOTAL

OUTSTANDING STATEMENT (S) *

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

* PLEASE DISREGARD IF PAID

August
INVOICE
Page

13, 2003

NO. 666666

2

FEDEZAAL IRENTIFICATION NUMBER 1 3 5805070

990.00



WHITE & CASE
LIMITED LIABILITY PARTNERSHIP
FIRST UNION FINANCIAL CENTER
200 SOUTH BiISCAYNE BOULEVARD, SUITE 4900
Miami, FLORIDA 33131-2352

The City of Dania Beach August 13, 2003
Attn: Thomas J. Anskro INVOICE NO. 666666
Ref. No. 15041927-0C02 Page 3

FEDERAL JDENTIFICATION NUMBER 1 3-3503070

TIME SUMMARY

TIMEKEEPER TITLE HOURS

4291 THOMAS MCALTLEY Level 2 3.00
TOTALS 3.00



LIMITEDQ LIABILITY PARTNERSHIP

\%\GX WHITE & CASE 7/’}63

FIRST UNION FINANCIAL CENTER l’ 4%
200 SOUTH BiscAaYNE BOULEVARD, SUITE 4900 4 6 43
0

Miaml, FLORIDA 33 131-2352 60‘3
p,

The City of Dania Beach ~July 15, 2003

Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro INVOICE NO. €63391
3107 Stirling Road

Suite 300 560 6"1_70
F't. Lauderdale, FL, 33312 |€5’

FEDERAL ICENTIFICATION HUMBER 1 3.4803970

re EIS CONSULTATION ‘
Ref. No. 1504197-0002 ' g o4

. L
_ FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in ‘ dﬁ-h
connection with the above-referenced matter

for the period ending June 30, 2003 N
as folliows: LD

Ce

LI 3
P

-3
H

06/04/03 Telephone conversation with r meaLiLgy AUG 18 2003 o
Brenda Chalifour regarding
current status of EIS.

FINANCE DEPT.
06/18/03 Review agenda for Airport T MCALDITEY .10
Advisory Committee Task
Force meeting.

06/23/03 Telephone conversations with T MCALILEY .30
Lorie Mertens and Tom Ansbro.

06/2¢/03 BRoview email from Lorie
Mertens.

06/30/03 Review issues related to T MCALILEY .10
Lorie Mertens email.

(!

MCALILEY .10

C___________.__—.-__...__—-——-—‘-—-—'——‘————-—-.

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES 5 363.00

COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS

=10
Photoccopying 2;? .44

(01 130210 53315



WHITE & CASE
LIMITED LIABILITY PARTHERSHIFP
FiRrsT UNION FINANCIAL CERTER
200 S0UTH BISCAYNE BOULEVARD, SUITE 4900
MiaMiy, FLORIDA 33!31-2a352

The City of Dania Beach July 15, 2003

Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro INVOICE NO. 663391

Ref. No. 1504197-0002 Page 2
TOTAL COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS $ .44
TOTAL $ 363.44
OUTSTANDING STATEMENT (S) * .1,010.22
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE 5 1,373.66

* PLEASE DISREGARD IF PAID



TN AWiaaa

FLORIDA

November 26, 2003

Mr. Ken Cohen
Assistant City Manager
Town of Davie

6591 Orange Drive
Davie, FL 33314-3399

RE: Airport Expansion Related Attorney Fees

Dear Mr. Cohen:

Enclosed are copies of three invoices from White and Case for services related to the
airport expansion issue for August, September and Qctober, 2003. Please review the
invoices and remit the Town of Davie's share to the City of Dania Beach. itis my
understanding that you have agreed to be responsible for one-third of the total cost.

Should you need further information, please do not hesitate to contact me at (954) 924-
3620.

Sincerely yours,

- Ve
it I

Patricia Varney
Director of Finance

Copy: Ivan Pato
City Manager

“Broward’s First City”

1™ 0 ™ [ T



The

Attn:

WHITE & CASE .

LIMITED LIABILITY PARTNERSHIP

FirsT UNION FINANCIAL CENTER
200 SOUTH BISCAYNE BOULEVARD, SUITE 4900

MiaMI, FLORIDA 32131-23a52

City of Dania Beach
Thomas J. Ansbro

3107 Stirling Road
Suite 300

i

10/02/03

10/06/03

10/07/03

10/08/03

10/08/03

10/10/03

Lauderdale, FL, 33312

re EIS CONSULTATION
Ref. No. 1504197-0002

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED
connection with the above-referenced wmatter

for the period ending October. 31,

as fecllows:

Review Leigh Fisher report
on airport alternatives;
telephone call to Lorie
Mertens (Heollywood) ;
telephone call to Ivan Pato
(Dania Beach).

Telephone conversation with
Brenda Chalifour.

Telephone conversation with
Brenda Chalifour.

Telephone conversation with
Tom Ansbro; email
correspondence with Jay
Field {Dania Beach Airport
Advisory Committee) .

Telephone conversation with
Tom Ansbro; email
correspondence with Jay
Field.

Telephcone call with Kathy in
Ivan Pato's office
concerning logistics for
client meeting.

T

T

November 7, 2003
INVOICE NO. 677992
FEQENAL IDERTIFICATION HUMBER |13 2805070
in
2003
MCALILEY .60
MCALILEY .30
MCALILEY .10
MCALILEY .30
MCALILEY -30
MCALILEY .10

' i
..,’.‘ s ﬂ%.‘ha



WHITE & CASE

LIMITED LIABILITY FPARTNERSHIF

FIRST UNION FINANCIAL CENTER
200 S0UTH BISCAYNE BOULEVARD, SUITE 4500
MIAMI, FLORIDA 33131-2352

The City of Dania Beach
Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro

Ref. No.

10/15/03

10/16/03

10/28/03

10/30/03

1504137-0002

Prepare for meeting with
Dania Beach officials
concerning response to
recent developments; attend
meeting with Ivan Pato, Jay
Field, and Tom Ansbro;

conversation with Bob Mikes.

Telephone conversation with
Brenda Chalifour.

Draft proposed response to
recent articles by airline
executives; review factual
materials in preparation of
response; review Leigh
Figher materials; draft
email to Mr. Jay Field
{(Dania Beach) concerning
information needs in
relaticon to Leigh Fisher
report.

Telephone conversation with
Lorie Mertens; email
correspondence with Brenda
Chalifour concerning draft
response to recent airline
executive statements;
transmit draft response to
clients.

November 7, 2003
INVOICE NO. 6773992

Page 2
T MCALILEY 2.50
T MCALILEY .20
T MCALILEY 3.70
T MCALILEY .30



WHITE & CASE
LIMITED LIAB:LITY PAATNERSHIP
FIRST UNION FINANCIAL CENTER
200 SOUTH BISCAYNE BOULEVARD, SUITE 4900
Miaml, FLOR!DA 33131-2352

The City of Dania Beach November 7, 2003
Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro INVOICE NO. 677992
Ref. No. 1504197-00C02 Page 3
FEDERAL IDERTIFICATION NUMBER | 3 23e08270
10/31/03 Email éorrespondence T MCALILEY .20

regarding draft article;
review contract between
Broward County and Landrum &

EBrown.
TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES ' $ 2,838.00
/ 1.In

COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS 450

Photocopying 12.72
Word Processing 23.50
TOTAL COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS S 36.22
TOTAL 3 2,874 .22
OUTSTANDING STATEMENT (S) * 99 .88
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE 3 2,974.10

* PLEASE DISREGARD IF PAID



WHITE & CASE
LIMITED LIABILITY PARTNERSHIF
FIRST UNION FINANCIAL CENTER
200 S0uUTH BISCAYNE BOULEVARD, SUITE 4900
MIAMI, FLORIDA 33131{-2352

The City of Dania Beach November 7, 2003
Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro INVOICE NO. 677992
Ref. No. 1504197-0002 Page 4

FEOERAL {DENTIFICATION HUMBEH | 3 5803070

TIME SUMMARY

TIMEKEEPER TITLE HOURS

4291 THOMAS MCALILEY Level 2 8.60
TOTALS 8.60



WHITE & CASE
LIMITEDR LIABILITY PARTNERSHIF
FIRST UNION FINANCIAL CENTER
200 SOUTH BiscAaYnNE BOULEVARD, SUITE 4ag00
Miami, FLORIDA 3313)1-2352

The City of Dania Beach Octcber 14, 2003

Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro

3107 Stirling Road INVOICE MO .0c6 7460 8umecn 51000000
Suite 300

Ft. Lauderdale, FL, 33312

re EIS CONSULTATION
Ref. No. 1504197-0002

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in
connection with the above-referenced matter
for the period ending September 30, 2003
as follows:

09/09/03 Review materials regarding T MCALILEY .10
Ft. Lauderdale actions
related to airport expansion.

09/11/03 Telephone conversation with T MCALILEY .20
Brenda Chalifour regarding
recent developments.

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 99.00
COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS

Photocopying .88

TOTAL COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS ] .88



WHITE & CASE
LIMITED LIABILITY FARYTNERSHIF
First UNn1oN FinanCilal CENTER
200 SOUTH BISCAYNE BOULEVARD, SUITE 4900
MtAaMI, FLORIDA 33131-235¢2

The City of Dania Beach October 14, 2003
Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro INVOICE NO. 674608
Ref. No. 1504197-0002 Page 2

TOTAL

OQUTSTANDING STATEMENT (S) *

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

* PLEASE DISREGARD IF PAID



WHITE & CASE
LIMITED LIABILITY PARTNERGSHIF
FirsT UNtON FINANCIAL CENTER
200 SOUTH BISCAYNE BOULEVARD, DUITE 4900
Miaml, FLORIDA 3313:1-2352

The City of Dania Beach October 14, 2003
Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro INVOICE NO. 674608
Ref. No. 1504187-0002 Page 3

FEDERAL ABENTIFICATION HUMBER 13 5803870

TIME SUMMARY

TIMEKEEPER TITLE HOURS FEES

T MCALILEY Level 2 .30 99,00

TOTALS ¢.30 99,00



LIMITED LIABILITT PARTNERSHIF

FIRST UNION FINANCIAL CENTER /

200 SOQUTH BISCAYNE BOQULEVARD, SUITE 4900
MiaMl, FLORIDA 33131-2352

| B\C)\/\ WHITE & CASE 86]6/!/ |

%

The City of Dania Beach September 22, 2003
Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro INVOICE NOQ. 671559
3107 Stirling Read

Suite 3200

Ft. Lauderdale, FL, 33312 R& A/,EPOQ;{/

ool 030 ~83-3/S

re EIS CONSULTATION
Ref. No. 1504187-0002

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in
connection with the above-referenced matter
for the period ending August 31, 2003
as follows:

08/11/03 Review of materials related T MCALILEY 0CT 17-60.
to Ft. Lauderdale interlocal T
agreement and Broward County !
contract bids; telephone EN NIRRT P
calls to Tem Ansbro and URTRLEHE DEPT,
Brenda Chalifour.

L4
-

08/25/03 Review materials received T MCALILEY .10
regarding Broward County
actions.

TOTAL PRCFESSIONAL FEES s 231.00

COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS

Computer Legal Research 53.08
Photocopying 1.27
Postage 2.22

TOTAL COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS $ 56.57



WHITE & CASE

LIMITES LIABILITY FPARTNERSHIP

FIRST UNION FINANCIAL CENTER
200 SOUTH BiSCAYNE BOULEVARD, SUITE 4900
MiaMt, FLORIDA 33131-2352

The City of Dania Beach

September 22, 2003
Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro INVOICE NO. 6715566
Ref. No. 1504197-0002 . Page 2

FEDERAL IDENTIFICATION NUMBER | 3 500%870

TOTAL




WHITE & CASE
LIMITED L1aBI ITY PARTNERSHIFP
FIRST UNION FINANCIAL CENTER
200 SOUTH BISCAYNE BOULEVARD, SUITE 4900
Miam1, FLORIDA 332131-22352

The City of Dania Beach September 22, 2003
Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro INVCICE NO. 671559
Ref. No. 1504197-0002 Page 3

FEDERAL IDENTIFICATION NUMBER | 3 58030870

TIME SUMMARY
TIMEKEEPER TITLE HOURS

4291 THOMAS MCALILEY Level 2 0.70
TOTALS 0.70



FLORIDA

January 30, 2004

Mr. Ken Cohen
Assistant City Manager
Town of Davie

6591 Orange Drive
Davie, FL 33314-3399

RE: Airport Expansion Related Attorney Fees

Dear Mr. Cohen:

Enclosed are copies of two invoices from White and Case for services related to the
airport expansion issue for November and December, 2003. Please review the invaices
and remit the Town of Davie’s share to the City of Dania Beach. It is my understanding
that you have agreed to be responsibie for one-third of the total cost.

Should you need further information, please do not hesitate to contact me at {954} 924-
3620.

Sincerely yours,

3 /

Patricia Varney
Director of Finarce

Copy: Ivan Pato
City Manager

“Broward’s First City”

1O Wrer Thania Banch Baalasraed Thawin Banck Tlaoide a2anid DL . L

FOVE A% A s



,bf\o\

The City of Dania Beach
Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro
3107 Stirling Road
Suite 300

Ft. Lauderdale, 33312

FL,

re EIS CONSULTATION
Ref. No. 1504197-0002

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED
connection with the above-refere o’}
for the peried ending November 30, 2003 e

as follows:

Receive and review auditor's
inquiry letter. Commence
routing,

11/14/03

Attention to audit inguiry
letter.

11/17/03

Telephone conversation with
Tom Ansbro.

11/24/03

Review Leigh Fisher report;
telephone conversation with
Ivan Pato, Mayor Anton, and
Tom Ansbro; telephone
conversation with Toby
Brigham; attend presentation
by Clean Airport
Partnership; conversations
with officials from Dania
Beach and Davie.

11/25/03

.1/26/03 Draft audit letter response.

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES

COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS

NI 1tbrv~ Bl 2 t &)

WHITE & CASE
LIMITED LIABILITY FPARTNERSHIA
WACHOVIA FINANCIAL CENTER, SUITE 4900
200 SOUTH BISCAYNE BOULEVARD
Miami, FLGRIDA 33131-2352

December 3, 2003
INVQICE NO. 682709
in
ed matter
ey
toot - B
v S
™ WAGON}_E_MM__W.____“___H_J .34
L TTERT,
D T MACNAUGHTON .10
T MCALILEY .20
T MCALILEY 6.40
M WAGONER 1.00
S 2,413.60
- uy nlf(é('
- ol
\\tlbl U NN



WHITE & CASE
LIMITED LIABILITY PARYNERSHIP
WACHOVIA FINANCIAL CENTER, SUITE 4900
200 SOUTH BuUSCAYNE BOULEVARD
MiaMi, FLORIDA 3313i-25352

2003
682709

FEQEMAL IDENTIFICATION HUMBER | 35800870

The City of Dania Beach December 9,

Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro INVOICE NO,

Ref. No. 1504197-0002 Page 2
Photocopying

TOTAL COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS

TOTAL $

OQUTSTANDING STATEMENT (S) *

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE 3

* PLEASE DISREGARD IF PAID



WHITE & CASE
LIMITED LIABILITY PARTHNERSHIP
WACHOVIA FINANCIAL CENTER, SUITE 4800
200 SGUTH BISCAYNE BOULEVARD
MiaMI, FLORIDA 3313i-23%2

December 9, 2003

The City of Dania Beach
INVOICE NO. 682708

Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro

Ref. No. 1504197-0002 Page 3
FECERAL IDENTIFICATION NUMBER | 3-3808070
TIME SUMMARY
TIMEKEEPER TITLE HOURS
0147 DT MACNAUGHTON Partner 0.1¢C
4291 THOMAS MCALILEY Level 2 6.60
0224 M WAGONER Legali Assistant : i.30

TOTALS 8.00



The

WHITE & CASE

LIMITED LIABILITY PARTNERSHIP

WacHOviA FINANCIAL CENTER, SUITE 4800
200 SOUTH BISCAYNE BOULEVARD

MiaM), FLORIDA 33131-2352

City of Dania Beach

Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro
3107 Stirling Road
Suite 300

Ft.

12/01/03

12/03/03

12/03/03

12/04/03

12/05/03

Lauderdale, FL, 33312

re EIS CONSULTATION
Ref. No. 1504197-0002

January 12, 2004
INVOICE NO. 687278

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

connection with the above-referenced matter

for the period ending December 31, 2003

as follows:

Telephone conversations with
Ivan Pato, Tom Ansbro, Mayor
Anton, and Scott Marder:
transmit materials to Ivan
Pato.

Finalize audit letter
response.

Telephone conversations with
Brenda Chalifour, Toby
Brigham, and Tom Ansbro;
review media reports
regarding Broward County
Commigsion meetings.

Telephone conversations with
Davie officials and Brenda
Chalifour; attend and make
presentation at meeting of
Davie Town Council.

Telephone conversgsation with
Davie officials; telephone
conversation with Miami
Herald reporter; telephone
conversation with Brenda
Chalifour.

T MCALILEY

M WAGONER

T MCALILEY

T MCALILEY

T MCALILEY

FEDERMAL IDERTIFICATION ML

Uil 1

.80

.50

.50

.60

HMBEA | BEDIRTO

Y

y \47
)] ,g/ﬂV



WHITE & CASE
LIMITED LIABILITY FARTNERSH(IF
WACHOVIA FINANCIAL CENTER. SurTe 4500
200 SOUTH BISCAYNE BOULEVARD
MiIAMI, FLORIDA 33131-2352

January 12, 2004
INVOICE NC. 687278
2

The City of Dania Beach
Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro
Ref. No. 1504197-0002 Page

FEDERAL IDENTIFICATION NUMBER 1J3-3803B70

12/10/03 Telephone conference with T MCALILEY .70

Ivan Pato, Bob Mikes, and
Tom Ansbro regarding County
Commission decision;
telephone conversations with
Brenda Chalifour regarding
same.,

12/15/03 Telephone conversation with T MCALILEY .20
Jared Shultz (concerned
regident) .

12/16/03 Telephone conversation with T MCALILEY .40

Lorie Mertens; telephone

conversation with Tom Ansbro.
12/17/03 Telephone conversation with T MCALILEY .10
Lorie Mertens' office
ceoncerning meeting.

12/24/03 Telephone conversation with T MCALILEY .30

Davie resident (referred by
member of Davie Airport
Advisory Committee).

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 2,637.50

COSTS ANL DISBURSEMENTS

Photocopying 5.18
.37

Postage



WHITE & CASE
LIMITED LIABILITY PARTNERSHIFP
WacHOVIA FINANCIAL CENTER, SUITE 4800
200 50UTH BISCAYNE BOULEVARD
Miami, FLORIDA 33131-2352

January 12, 2004

The City of Dania Beach
INVOICE NO, 687278

Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro

Ref. No. 1504197-0002 Page 3
Facsimile 23.75
TOTAL CQOSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS [ 29.30
TCOTAIL: 3 2,666.80
d
OUTSTANDING STATEMENT (S)* 241540 f_’q of
''''' 2466.90

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE [ —n 8220

* PLEASE DISREGARD IF PAID



WHITE & CASE
LIMITED LIABILITY PARTRERSHIFP
WACHOVIA FINANCIAL CENTER, SUITE 4900
200 SOUTH BISCAYNE BOULEVARD
MIaMi, FLORIDA 33131-2382

January 12, 2004
INVOICE NO. 687278
4

The City of Dania Beach
Attn: Thomas J. aAnsbro
Ref. No. 1504197-0002 Page

FEPEMAL IDENTEFICATION NUMBER 13-34D88 70

TIME SUMMARY

TIMEKEEPER TITLE HOURS
4291 THOMAS MCALILEY Level 2 7.80
0924 M WAGCNER Legal Assistant 0.50

TOTALS 8.30



FLORIDA

July 8, 2004

Mr. Ken Cohen
Assistant City Manager
Town of Davie

6591 Orange Drive
Davie, FL. 33314-3399

RE: Airport Expansion Related Attorney Fees

Dear Mr. Cohen:

Enclosed are copies of four invoices from White and Case for services related to the
airport expansion issue for January through May, 2004, Please review the invoices and

remit the Town of Davie's share te the City of Dania Beach.

Should you need further information, please do not hesitate to contact me at (954) 924-
3620,

Sincerely yours,
Pl

Patricia Varney
Director of Finance

Copy. Ivan Pato
City Manager

“Broward’s First City”
100 West Dania Beach Boulevard Dania Beach, Florida 33004 Phone: (954) 924-3600 www.ci.dania-beach.fl.us
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g WHITE & Case
a0 LIMITED LIABILITY maMTNEAS HiE
WacHovia FiNaANCIAL CENTER. SUITE s9Cc0o
200 SOUTH BISCAYNE BouLevaro
MiAMI, FLORIDA 33131-23852

. The City of Dania Beach February 17, 2004

Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro INVOICE NO. 532763D
3107 Stirling Road REVISED
' Suilte 300

Ft. Lauderdzle, FL, 33312

FESERALIDESTIFICATION AUMBER 3. 5801

L re EIS CONSULTATION
o Ref. No. 1504197-0002

FOR PROFESS IONAL SERVICES RENDERED in
connecticn with the above-referenced matter
for the period ending January 31, 2004
as follows:

+ Q1/06/04 Telephone conversation with T MCALILEY .30
Dania Beach resident
concerning airport expansion
issues; review updates
regarding County Commission
decisicns.

01/07/04 Office conference with N, D HALSEY .20
MCAliley regarding strateqgy.

01/07/04 Telephone conversation with T MCALILEY .90
. Tom Ansbro; identify options

to address potential

condemnations in Dania Beach.

- 01/08/04 Research re: condemnation E SWENSON 3.20
oo authority; condemnation

exceptions;delegation of

eminent domain authority by

the FAA; relocation of

displaced persons; research

codes, statutes, cases re:

Same; prep., memorandumn

§561/09/04 Continue eminent domain E SWENSON .70

Lesearch re: rules and
procedures; draft memorandum

re: same.



. FRCM (MON) 5. 1704 15:30/8T. 15:29/N0. 4600000976 P 3
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WHITE & Caske

LIMITED ClARILITY B AATHEmS -

WAaCHOVIA FINANCIAL CenTer, SuitE 4500
200 SOUTH BiscarynE BOouULEvaRD
Miami, FLomiDaA 3313v-22352

o ﬁhe City of Dania Beact ' February 17, 2004
‘ ‘- Thomas J. Rasbro INVOICE NO. 6%2763D
- No. 1504197-00Q02 Page 2

01/14/04 Prepare for meeting with T MCALILEY 6.30
: clients; meeting with

representatives from Dania

Beach, Davie, and Hollywood

regarding recent Rroward

County decision and upcomirg

action steps; legal research

regarding eminent domain

issues; legal research

regarding FAA rules

governing airport-related

land acquisition; prepare

list of questions for

Broward County cfficials

regarding its recent

decisions and gtpcoming plans.

01/15/04 Meeting with Tom Ansbro T MCALILEY 1.80
’ {Dania Beach) and Andy
¢ Shuster (Brigham & Mocre)
concerning eminent domain
issues related to airport
expansion.

.01/21/04 Research re: federal funding E SWENSON 2.80
for eminent domain and local
government ownership of
residual funds after sales
of property.

01/22/04 Research re: federal funding E SWENSON 6.20
of eminent domain; research
authority of county to annex
cities
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WHITE & Case
LIMITES LiadiLaty PaRTHNEM S M
WACHOVMFﬁNANCMLCENTEP‘Suwsdscc
200 SOUTH Biscarne BOULEVARD
Miami. FLORIDA 33131-2a5z2

;;f@he City of Dania Besach February 17, 2004
“uUAttn: Thomas J. Ansbro INVOICE NO. 692763D
Ref. No. 1504197-0002 . Page 3

FELEAL, IQE~T FEATiION NUMSELR 1] 3g0vaGn

. B1/23/04 Research annexation power of E SWENSON 5.10
' lecal governments; research
Statutes, cases re: same.

01/27/04 Research re: powerline E SWENSON €.49
siting; research rules,
regulations re: same.

SWENSON 4.60

=

01/28/04 Research re: florida public
service commission;
transmission power line
siting

© Q1/29/04 Research statutes, florida E SWENSON 4.30
administrative code re:
transmission line siting
procedures; draft memorandum
re;: same

01/29/04 Prepare for meeting of Davie T MCALILEY 6.00

Town Council; telephcne

conversations with Ivan

Pato, Tom Ansbro, and Lorie

Mertens; attend council

meeting and make

presentation; conversations

with clients from Davie,

Dania Beach, and Hollywood.

.01/30/04 Draft memorandum re: E SWENSON 4.190
transmission powerline
siting act; research re:
same.
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5

i
'

FROM
WHITE & Case
LIMITED LiagroaTy PAMTNERSH | B
WaCHOVIA FINANCIAL CENTER, SuiTE 4900
200 SouTH Biscavne BouLeEVvaro
Miam, FLORIDA 33131.-2a832
' The'City of Dania Beach February 17, 2004
Attn: Thomas J. ANsbrag INVOICE NOQ. 692763D
Ref. No. 1504197-0002 Page 4
01/30/04 Telephone cenversation with T MCALILEY .30
Brenda Chalifour: review
issues related to Airport
Master Plan.
' TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 18,865.00
COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS
Computer Legal Research 590.54
Miscellaneous Other 44,20
Photocopying 40.80
Word Processing 260,00
TOTAL COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS 5 935.54
TOTAIL 5 19,800.54
LESS CREDIT - 10,000.00
T
. TOTAL AMOUNT DUES i & s ( 2,800.54
| .
\ /ki e 77
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_FROM

WHITE & CasE

LIMITED LiagiaTy FAH"'NQI!SI-HF

WACHOVIA FINANCIAL CENTER. SUITE 4000
200 S0UTH Biscaryng BouLeEvare
MiaMI, FLORIDA 3213i1-2a52

The City of Dania Beach February 17, 2004
Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro INVOICE NC. 63527630
Ref. No, 1504197-0002 Page 5

FEREAAL OCATEFICATION Ny=arER 13 2aps0ra

TIME SUMMARY
TIMEKEEPER TITLE HOURS
3216 D HALSEY Partner 0.20
4291  THOMAS MCALILEY Level Al 15.20
3218 E SWENSON Level 7 5¢.40

TOTALS 65.80



WEISS SErROTA HELFMAN

PastOor1iZA GUEDES COLE & BONISKE, P.A.
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

MITCHELL &. BIERMAN BROWARD OFFICE ELAINE M, COMEN
NINA L BONISKE 3107 STIRLING ROAD, SUITE 300 WIVIAN DE LAS CUEVAS-DIAZ
MITCHELL J. BURNSTEIN *
STEPHANIE DEUTSCH
FORY LtAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 23312
JAMIE ALAN COLE JENNIFER A. GOLDBERG
ELWARD G. GUEDES —_— DOUGLAS R. GONZALES
STEFPHEN J. HELFMAN JAMIE ALAN COLE CHRISTOPHER F. KURTZ
< OHN R HERIN, JR. MANAGING SHAREHOLOER-BROWARD OFF ICE Ll s TS
HARRIET R. LEWIS KAREN LIEBERMAN"
GILBERTO PASTOR 124 T MATTHEW H, MaNDEL
GARY I, RESNICK TELEPHONE 954-763-4242 BERNARD 5. MANDLER"
JOSEFH H. SERCTA TELECORIER D54-764.7 770 MICHAEL 4. MARRERD
NANCY E. STROUD MWW WE H-LAW. COM ALEXANDER L. FALENZUELA-MAURI
RICHARD JAY WEISS MICHAEL 5, POPOK®
DAVID M. WOLRIN MIAMI-DADE OFFICE ANTHONY L. REGIC
STEVEN w. ZELKOWITZ 2665 SOUTH BAYSHORE DRIVE * SUITE 420 ECOTT A, ROBIN
MIAMI, FLORIDA 33133 ' GaiL O, SEROTA*
TELEPHONE 305-854-08C00 * TELECCPIER 305-854-2322 JEFFREY P. SHEFFEL

THOMAS J. ANSBRO™"
L]
LILLIAN ARANGO BE LA HOZ Mk M. BINGH
JOSE 5. TALAVEAA

ALISON 5, BIELER
L ]
MICHELLE BUCKALEW S et SUSAN L. TREVARTHEN®

April 27, 2004 ; RETE TS T

Ivan Pato, City Manager APR Z R 7004
City of Dania Beach . [
100 West Dania Beach Blvd. S :1
Dania Beach, FL. 33004

Re:  Revised February, 2004 Invoice for Airport Expansion Consultation (White and
Case Legal Services)

Dear Ivan:

Attached you will find copies of April 8, 2004 and April 14, 2004 letters sent to me by Neal
McAliley of the White and Case law firm, We all enjoy a very good working relationship with Neal and
we welcome the very able assistance rendered to the City by him and his firm.

1 did have occasion to discuss with him my concerns with a substantial amount of time (some
thirty plus hours) rendered by one of the firm's associates in January of this year on airport-related
research matters. Neal has been both considerate and gracious enough to substantially reduce the bill by
the sum of $10,000.00 (as a “credit™) for that month’s work. We genuinely cnjoy working with Neal and 1
thought 1t was commendable that he took the time and made the effort to address my concerns on behalf
of the City. By copy of this comespondence, I am thanking him, his associates and his firm for their
professionalism and courtesy in responding so positively to our efforts to maximize services and

minimize costs.

Very truly yours,

(T M

Thomas J. Ansbro
City Attomey
City of Dania Beach

566.028

TIAslw

Enclosures

cc: Mayor and Commission
Patty Vamey, Finance Director
Neal McAliley, Esq.
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LOS AMGELES
MMI1AMI AMKARS
T WHITE & CASE
FALD ALTOD . BOMBAY/MUMBAL
SAMFRANCISCO LIMITED LIABILITY PARTHERSH P v HO CHI MINH CITY
WASHINGTOM, D C. HONG KONG
WACHOVIA FINANCIAL CENTER, SUITE 4900 JAKARTA
BERLIM S B SHANGHAT
SR AL 200 SOUTH BISCAYNE BOULEVARR LTI
BRUSS
SEEheE MiAmMI. FLORIDA 33131-2352 :
LRESDEN e L A _—
CUSSELDORF . . 5 . . e
SR DOR, TELEPHONE: (I1-305) 37i-2700 o
HAMBURG FACSIMILE: [I-305) 358-5744/5766
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ISTANBUL
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Mbcd.ilsLé:w MEXICO CITY
PR DIRECT DiaL: (305) 895.5255 EEaCAIEIEE
PRAGUE A .
ROME E-MaIL: nmcaliley@whitecase.com
ETOCKHOLM
WA RS AW LJOHANNESBLRG

April 14, 2004

My, Thomas . Ansbro

Weiss, Serota, Helfman

3107 Stirling Road, Suite 300
Ft. Lauderdale, Florida 33312

Re: Airport Expansion Consultation for City
of Dania Beach

Dear Tom:

I am writing to clarify my April 8, 2004 letter regarding this firms invoices in this case.
As you and I discussed, this firm agreed to reduce the amount billed for work done in January
2004 and reflected in the February 17, 2004 invoice by $10,000. Since the original invoice
identified $18,865 in fees, the $10,000 credit reflects a reduction of the fees by more than half
Attached to this letter are copies of the original February 17, 2004 invoice, and the revised

February 17, 2004 invoice that reflects the $10,000 credit.
Thank you for working with us on this. Please do not hesitate to give me a call if you
have any questions.

Sincerely,

v
-

s
£ T. \jeal McAliley

TNM:w

H1572004 9:18 AN [2K)

MiAM] 46468 vI
13econd Letter 10 Tom Ansbro 7e buls (4 12-04) DOC]



LOS ANGELES
MIAMI
HNEW YORK
Palo aLTO
SANFRANCISCO

WHITE & CASE

LIMITED LIABILITY PARTNERSHIP

ALMATY
AMNK AR A
BANGHONK
EOMBAY/MUME AL
HO SHIMINH CiTY
HONG KONG

WASHINGTON, D.C.
WACHOVIA FINANCIAL CENTER, SUITE 4900 JAKARTA
BERLIN SHANGHAL
O TR A 200 SOUTH BISCAYNE BOULEVARD SINGAPORE
BRUSSELS ToKYo
e MiaMI, FLORIDA 33131-2352
DRLSDEN
DUSSELDORF . = =
e R TELEPHONE: (I-308) 371-2700 .
HAMBURG FaCcssMILE: - 305) 358-5744/5766
HELS INKI
ISTANBLUL -
LONDON
”';'““ MEXICO CITY
Moscaw DIRECT DiaL: (305) $95.5255 SAO PauLO
PRAGUE . a
ROME E-MaiL: nmealiley@whitecase.com
STOCKHOLM
WARSAW JOHANNESBURG

April 8, 2004

Mr. Thomas J. Ansbro
Weiss, Serota, Helfman

3107 Stirhing Road, Suite 500
Ft. Lauderdale, Florida 33312

Re:  Airport Expansion Consuitation for City
of Danta Beach

Dear Tom:

I am writing to follow-up on our discussions concerning recent invoices to the C ity of
Dania Beach. As you know, this firm has been spending more time on this matter as a result of
the County Commission’s December 2003 decision to further expand the Ft. Lauderdale-
Hollywood International Airport. However, based on our conversations, we are agreeing to a
credit of $10,000, that will be applied to our April 2004 invoice. This credit should resolve any

1ssues related to our most recent invoices.

Thank you for working with us on this. Please do not hesitate to give me a call if you
“have any questions.

Sincerely,
7
4 T. McAliley

TNM.w

AB2004 3 19 PM (2K)
MIAMI 468851 vl [468581_1.DOC)



Ft.

(MON)
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LIMITED LIABILITY PARTHERS e

/] q WHITE & CASE

200 S0OUTH BISCAYNE BouLevarD
MIAMI, FLORIDA 2313(-2352

The City of Dania Beach
Attn: Thomas J. Anshro
3107 Stirling Road
Suite 300

Lauderdale, FL, 33312

WACHOVIA FINANCIAL CENTER, SINTE 4900

April 8, 2004
INVOICE NO. 58951313

LT

£02/02/04

102/03/04

02/04/04

02/08/04

12/10/04

)3/23/04

re EIS CONSULTATION
Ref. No. 1504197-0002

FOR PROFESSIONAIL SERVICES RENDERED in
connection with the above-referenced matter
for the period ending March 31, 2004

as follows:

Review materials received
from Brenda Chalifour.

Legal research regarding
noigse mitigation measures
and Part 150 studies.

Review Broward County
memorandum regarding
planning activities for
airport expansion; outline
action steps.

Telephone conversation with
Brenda Chalifour; compose
email to clients regarding
upcoming Broward County
Commission hearing on BCAD's
"Runway Implementation Plan."

Research re: county
annexation of city property;
memorandum re: same

Review draft letter to
County Commission concerning
mitigation issues.

MCALILEY

MCALILEY

MCALILEY

MCALILEY

SWENSCON

MCALILEY

2

.40

.60

.20

(:Xf)z/ /(9%%£>(:) fgryrtff :ES /réggfi>
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(MON} 6. 14" 04 12:08/ST. 12:07.-NO. 480000058 P 3

WHITE & CAste
LIMITED LIASILITY PARTHERSHIP
WACHDvmlﬁNANCMLCENTER,SUWEAQOO
200 SouTH BiscAvyNE BouLEvarD
MiaM!, FLORIDA 33131-2352

ﬂThé City of bania BReach April 8§, 2004

02/25/04

©02/26/04

dé/26/04

02/27/04

03/02/04

regarding relocating power
lines; telephone
conversation with Tom Ansbro.

Research re: procedures to E SWENSCN 6.60
amend airport master plans

and environmental impact

statements; memorandum re:

same .

Review of legal iscues T MCALILEY .50
related to potential

deannexation of City of

Dania Beach, Broward County

use of federal mitigation

dollars, and ongoing noise

mitigation issues.

Draft memorandum re: airport E SWENSON 8.00
master plans; research re:

procedures to update Part

150 noise studies;

memorandum re: same.

Telephone conversation with T MCALILEY .10
City Manager Pato's office

regarding document

production.

v e SaTo=r

{Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro " INVOICE NO. 699533
1504137-0002 Page 2
FEQER L (OZHIFICATION MUMBEMR 13 4808370
Review legal research T MCALILEY .20
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WHITE & CASE
LIMITED LiABILITY FARTNERSHIM
WaACHOVIA FINANCIAL CENTER, SUITE 4500
200 SOUTH BISCAYNE BOULEVARD
Miami, FLORIDA 3313(-2352

iThe City of Dania Beach April 8, 2004
ttn: Thcemas J. Ansbro INVOICE NO. 6995%33
f. No. 1504197-0002 Page 3

FEBERAL IDENTIFICATION HUHBE® | ) $403890

o E _ :
e = e e T e——— EHo L e e
—_———=——— = = = BBREE S ot & O e rale— e T = tamr o= TR

03/17/04 Telephone conversations with T MCALILEY 1.00
Stephanie Osborne (Davie)
regarding mitigation issues:
telephcne call to Tom Willi
(Davie) .

'03/18/04 Telephone conversation with T MCALILEY .80
: Ivan Pato and Bob Mikes

(Dania Beach) concernlng

noise mitigation issues;

review materials related to

airline meeting.

03/19/04 Telephone conversations with T MCALILEY .40
Tom Willi (Davie} and Tom
Angsbro (Dania Beach).

‘03/22/04 Regearch on SEIS issues. E GOLDENBERG .50

03/23/04 Review correspondence T MCALILEY 1.50
: between Dania Beach and
Broward County concerning
mitigation; draft responsive
letter; prepare for meeting
with Dania Beach clients
regarding mitigation isggues.

03/24/04 Office conference with E GOLDENBERG 2.30
N. McAliley re: potentlal
contract issues ariging from
interlocal agreement with
Broward County; research re:
same .
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WHITE & CAsE
LIMITED LIABILITY BART NEMmSHIm~
WacCHOVIA FINANCIAL CENTER, SUITE ago00
200 SOUTH BISCATYNE BOULEVARD
Miami, FLORIDA 33131-2382

Clty of Dania Beach April 8, 2004

;Ai:tn Themas J. Ansbro INVOICE NO. 699533
'Ref. No. 1504197-0002 Page 4

FEDEFAL IDENTIFICATION HUMBER 13 8803070

03/24/04 Review issues related to T MCALILEY 5.00
enforceability of interlocal
agreement; prepare for
meeting with Dania Beach
clients regarding mitigaticn
issues; meeting with Dania
Beach client representatives
regarding mitigation issues.

"03/25/04 Review County litigation D HALSEY .10
- options with N. McAliley.

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES 3 9,782.50

COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS

Computer Legal Research 14.31
Photocopying 1.95
Word Processing 35.25
TOTAL COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS $ 51.51



FROM ’ : (MON) 6. 14' 04 12:009/8T. 12:07/NO. 4800000569 P &

WHITE & CASE
LIMITED LIABILITY FPARTHERSHI®
WacHOVIA FINANCIAL CENTER, SUITE 4900
200 SOUTH BISCAYNE BOULEVARD
Miami, FLORIDA 33131-2352

' The City of Dania Beach April 8, 2004
Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro INVOICE NO. 659533
.Ref. No. 1504197-0002 Page 5

FEQEAAL AGENTIFICATION NUHBER 1 3-2805970

TOTAL

QUTSTANDING STATEMENT (5) *

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

* PLEASE DISREGARD IF PAID
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WHITE 5 CASE
LIMITED LIABILITY FARTNERSHIP
WaACHOVIA FINANCIAL CENTER, SUITE 4900
200 SouUTH BisCAYNE BOULEVARD
Miaml, FLORIDA 33131-2352

The City of Dania Beach April 8, 2004
Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro INVOICE NO. 699533
"Ref. No. 1504197-0002 - Page 6

FEBERAL DEHTIFICATION HUHBER 13 2003970

TIME SUMMARY

TIMEKEEPER TITLE HOURS
3216 D HALSEY Partner 0.10
4291 THOMAS MCALILEY Level Al 11.20
3218 E GOLDENBERG Level S 2.80
3219 E SWENSON Level 7 18.80

TOTALS 32.90



0

i

WHITE & CASE

LIMITED LiABILITY PARTNERSHI®

WACHOWAFHMNCMLCENTER,5UWE4900
200 SOUTH BISCAYNE BOULEVARD

MIAMI, FLORIDA 3313(-2352

.The City of Dania Beach
Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro
3107 Stirling Road
Suite 300

Ft.

02/06/04

04/05/04

04/08/04

04/13/04

th)/ /{{QD() f;7éf, 55 /’é;zi)

Lauderdale, FL, 33312

re EIS CONSULTATION
Ref. No. 1504197-0002

FOR PROFESSIONAI, SERVICES RENDERED in
connection with the above-referenced mattgr
for the pericd ending April 30, 2004 : i

as follows:

Telephone conversation with
Tom Ansbro; review materials
related to BCAD
implementation of RBroward
Commission decision.

Telephone conversation with
Tom Ansbro regarding
condemnation issues.

Telephone conversation with
Commissioner Bob Mikes
(Dania Beach); telephone
call to State Department of
Transportation.

Research regarding costs of
land acquisition in
condemnation and in
voluntary programs;
telephone conversation with
Ken Towcimak (FDOT general
counsel's office).

May 11, 2004
INVOICE NO. 702654

FECPERAL IDENTIFICATION NUMBER | 32808070

S S —

———

JUN 23 2004 !
T MCALILEY | -, .7 " .30 : 7,1
T MCALILEY .20
T MCALILEY .30
T MCALTILEY .40




WHITE & CASE

LIMITED LIABILITY FPARTHNERSH P

WaCHOVIA FINANCIAL CENTER, SUITE 4900

200 SOUTH BISCAYNE BOULEVARD
MIaM|, FLORIDA 33131-2352

The ity of Dania Beach May 11, 2004
Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro INVOICE NO. 702654
Ref. No. 1504197-0002 Page 2

FEDERAL IGENTIFICATION NUMBER | 3 3803@70

04/13/04 Meeting with N. McAliley C KLEMAWESCH 1.70
(0.2); conduct research for
information re: comparison
of government payment in
voluntary buyouts versus
condemnation actions.

04/14/04 Prepare for meeting at Dania T MCALILEY 5.80
Beach City Hall; telephone
conversations with Brenda
Chalifour, Bob Anton, and
Tom Ansbro; attend meeting
at Dania Beach.

04/14/04 Additional research for C KLEMAWESCH 1.30
information re: government
- payments in buyocuts versus
condemnation actions {1.2);
meeting with N. McAliley
(0.1).

04/15/04 Review materials regarding T MCALILEY .30
Broward County developments.

04/21/04 Review materials regarding T MCALILEY .30
Broward County Commissicn
discussions and consultant
studies on airport.

04/27/04 Organize documentation T MCALILEY .20
regarding FAA envirconmental
documents for airport
projects at Ft. Lauderdale
Alrport.



WHITE & CASE

LIMITED LIABILITY PARTNERSHI(F

WACHOVIA FINANCIAL CENTER, SUITE 4900
200 SOUTH BISCAYNE BOULEVARD
Miaml, FLORIDA 33131-2352

The ity of Dania Beach May 11, 2004
Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro INVOICE NO. 702654
Ref. No., 1504197-0002 Page 3
FEQERAL IDENTIFICATION NUMBER | 3-5805B70
TOTAIL: PROFESSIONAL FEES s 3,192.00

COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS

Computer Legal Research 54.84
Photocopying 16.84
Postage .60
TOTAL COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS S 72.28

TOTAL 5 3,264 .28

OUTSTANDING STATEMENT (S) * v b3x st

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE ' s

* PLEASE DISREGARD IF PAID



|
WHITE & CASE

LIMITED LIABILITY PARTNERSHIP

WACHOVIA FINANCIAL CENTER, SUITE 4900
200 SOUTH BlISCAYNE BOULEVARD
Miami, FLORIDA 331231-2382

The ity of Dania Beach May 11, 2004
Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro INVOICE NO. 702654
Ref. No. 1504187-0002 Page 4

FEOLRAL IDENTIFICATION NUMBEN | 3 3403970

TIME SUMMARY

TIMEKEEPER TITLE HOURS
4291 THOMAS MCALILEY Level Al 7.80
5542 CHRISTOPHER KLEMAWESCH Level R 3.00

TOTALS 10.80
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MITCHELL A. BIERMARK
NINA L. BONISKE
JAMIE ALAMN COLE
EDW_ 10 &. GUEDES
STE HEN J, HELFMAN
JOKN R, HERIN, JR.
GILBERTO PASTORIZA
GARY |. RESNICK
JOSEPH H, SEROTA
NANCY E. 3TROUD
RICHARD JAY WEISS
CAWVID M, WOLPIN
STEVEN W. ZELKOWITZ

THOMAS J, ANSBRC"
LILLIAN ARAMGS DE La HOZ®
ALISON 5. BIELER
MITCHELL J. BURNSTEIN
ELAINE M, COMEN
STEPHANIE DEUTSCH"

Ivan Pato, City Manager
City of Dania Beach

WEIss SErROTA HELFMAN
PAastORIZA GUEDES COLE & BoONISKE, PA.

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

BROWARD DFFICE
2107 STIRLING ROAD, SUITE 300
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 3332

JAMIE ALAN COLE
MANAGING SHAREHOLDER-BROWARD OFFICE

TELEFHONE 354-763-4242
TELECOPIER B5E4-764-7770
WWW. WESH-FLALAW.COM
MIAMI-RADE QFFICE
2565 50UTH BAYSHORE DRIVE » SUITE 4320
MIAMI, FLORIDA 33133

TELEPHONE 305-854-0800 * TELECCOPIER 305-B854-Z3F3

*OF COUNSEL

May 25, 2004

100 West Dania Beach Boulevard

Dania Beach, FL. 33004

Re: EIS Consultation

Dear Ivan:

JENNIFER A, SOLDBERG
DOUGLAS R. GONZALES
MARK B. KRAVITZ
CHRISTOPHER F. KURTZ
HARRIET . LEWIS®
PETER A. LICHTMAN
KAREN LIEDERMAN"
MATTHEW H, MANDEL
BERNARD S. MANDLER*
MICHAEL J. MARRERC
ALEXANDER L, PALENZUELA-MALIRI
MICHAEL 8. POPOK®
ANTHONY L. RECIO
MARK A. ROTHENBERG
SCOTT A, ROBIN

DANA J, SCHINDLER
GAlL O. SEROTA®
JEFFREY P, SHEFFEL
MIA M, SINGH

JOSE 5. TALAVERA
SUSAN L. TREVARTHEN

Enclosed please find invoice number 702654 in the sum of $32,898.83 from White &

Case, LLP for professional services rendered in the above-referenced matter in tlhc month of

April, 2004 (and a charge from February 6, 2004, both equaling $3,264.28)), whi

outstanding balance ($29,634.55).

¢h include an

Please remit payment directly to White & Case, LLP and enclose a copy of the invoice

to ensure proper credit. Should you have any questions, please feel free to contac|

TIA:sw
Enclosure

Siacerely,

Thomas’J. Ansbro

t me.



' WHITE & CASE 6'/1@‘
LIMITED LIABILITY FARTNERSHIP
WACHOVIA FINANCIAL CENTER, SUITE 4900
200 SOUTH BISCAYNE BOULEVARD
MiaAMI, FLORIDA 33131-235z2

The City of Dania Beach June 9, 2004

Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro INVOTICE NO. 706628
3107 Stirling Road

Suite 300

Ft. Lauderdale, FL, 33312

FEDERAL |IDENTIFICATION NUMBER | 3-2808@7%0

re EIS CONSULTATION
Ref. No. 1504197-0002

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in
connection with the above-referenced matter
for the period ending May 31, 2004
as follows:

05/20/04 Review recent Broward County T MCALILEY 4,60
consultant materials
concerning airport
expansion; telephone
conversations with Brenda
Chalifour; prepare for
meeting at Davie Town Hall;
attend and speak at meeting
at Davie Town Hall,

TOTAL PROFESSICNAL FEES $ 1,564.00
COCSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS

Photocopying
Facgimile

TOTAL COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS $ 17%.20



. WACHOVIA FINANCIAL CENTER, SUITE 4900
. : 200 SCOUTH BISCAYNE BOULEVARD
MiamI, FLORIDA 33131-2352

The City of Dania Beach
Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro
Ref. No. 1504197-0002

TOTAL

OUTSTANDING STATEMENT (S) *

TOTAL AMCUNT DUE

* PLEASE DISREGARD IF PAID

June 9, 2004
INVOICE NO. 706628
Page 2

FEDERAL [SENTIFICATION NUMBER |13-3803070




WHITE & CASE

LIMITED LIABILITY PARTNERSHIP

WACHOVIA FINANCIAL CENTER, SUITE 4800
200 SOUTH BiscaYyneE BouLEvVARD
Miami, FLORIDA 33131-2352

The City of Dania Beach
Attn: Thomas J. Ansbro
Ref. No. 1504197-0002

TIMEKEEPER

4291 THOMAS MCALILEY

TIME SUMMARY

TITLE

Level Al
TOTALS

June 9, 2004
INVOICE NO. 706628

Page

3

FEOERAL IDENTIFICATION KUMBER 3-BOOBGTO
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N
D

ALMATY

LOS AHGELES
' MIAM ANKARA
NEW YORK WHITE & CASE BANGKOK
PALO ALTO LIMITED LIABILITY PARTNERSHIP BOMBAY/MUMBAL
BAN FRANCISCO HGC CHY MiNH CITY
WASHINGYON, D.C. HONG KONGQ
WaCHOVIA FINANCIAL CENTER, SUITE 45800 JAKARTA
BERLIN SHANGHAY
LFSTERAT 200 SOUTH BISCAYNE BOULEVARD SINOAFORE
BRUSSELS UL
BT MiaMI, FLORIDA 32313i-2352
BORESDEN
DUSSELDORF TELEPHONE: {I- 305} 371-2700
FRANKFURT RITADH
HAMBURG FACSIMILE: (1-305) 358-5744/5766
HELSINKI
ISTANBUL
LONDDN
MILAN MEXICOQ CITY
A DIRECT DiAL: (305) 995-5255 shorauLo
“RoME E-MAiL: nmcaliley@whitecase.com
STOCKHOLM
WAR 5 AW JOHANKESBLRG
June 22, 2004

Mr. Thomas J. Ansbro

City Attorney

City of Dania Beach

100 West Dania Beach Bivd.
Dania Beach, Florida 33004

Re:  Airport Expansion Consultation for City
of Dania Beach

Dear Tom:

I am writing with regard to this firm’s invoices for its work on this matter. As you may
recall, White & Case LLP agreed to a $10,000 credit on its February invoice. The process of
documenting that credit may have caused some confusion, as the payment of the invoices is no
longer current. Invoices for services provided in May and June 2004 are attached.

Thank you for your help on this matter. Please give me a call if you have any questions.
If the City’s financial staff have any questions regarding the invoices, they can call Milexis
(“Milly”) Ramos in our accounting office at (305) 371-2700.

Sincerely, .
MMW ;)
TNM:t e &
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