MEMORANDUM

Department of Budget and Finance

To: Bob Rawls, Interim Town Administrator

From: Herb Hyman, CPPB, Procurement Manager
Through: Christopher Wallace, Budget and Finance Director
Date: June 1, 1999

Subject: Aggregates

The attached resolution is for the supply of aggregates for various projects. Broward
County acted as lead agency for the Broward Co-operative Purchasing Group in bidding
this commodity. The bid is awarded to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder for
each item.

Please contact me if you have any questions.



RESOLUTION NO.

A RESOLUTION OF THE TOWN OF DAVIE, FLORIDA, ACCEPTING THE
BID FOR AGGREGATES, BROWARD CO-OP BID #ED98283G1.

WHEREAS, the Town is in need of aggregates for various projects; and

WHEREAS, Broward County, acting as lead agency for the Broward Cooperative
Purchasing Group, has solicited sealed bids for such aggregates; and

WHEREAS, after review, the Town Council wishes to accept the bid awarded by
Broward County to Florida Superior Sand, Tenex Enterprises, and L.B. Trucking &
Construction.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN
OF DAVIE, FLORIDA:

SECTION 1. The award made by Broward County, co-op bid #ED98283G1, to Florida
Superior Sand, Tenex Enterprises, and L.B. Trucking & Construction in accordance with
the attached unit pricing, is hereby accepted by the Town Council.

SECTION 2. The Town Council hereby authorizes the expenditure from the
operating budget of each using department.

SECTION 3. This resolution shall take effect immediately upon its passage and

adoption.

PASSED AND ADOPTED DAY OF , 1999
MAYOR/COUNCILMEMBER

Attest:

TOWN CLERK

APPROVED THIS DAY OF , 1999
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Purchasing Division

™ — ) 115 8. Andrews Avenue, Room 212

B A fort Loudarddale, FL 33307

BROWARD COUNTY (054) 3575065 » FAX (954) 357-8535
May 5, 1999

#650085242 0

Florida Superior Sand

1489 West Palmetto Park Rd., Suijte #438
Boca Raton, FL 33486

Att: Andrew Arena, Vice President

REFERENCE: BID #ED98283G1 for Aggregates, Top Dressing and Sand, Co-Op Contract
(REBID) for Items Groups 2B and Groups 3B

Gentlemen’

This is to confirm that the Board of County Commissioners at its Meeting held on April 27, 1999
under Agenda Tten No. 15 accepted your Bid on the above-referenced solicitation.

A Bid tabulation of all Bids received is enclosed, with item(s) awarded to your firm underiined.

The Contract is in effect for the period beginning April 27, 1999 and ending April 26, 2000.
Purchase Order(s) will be placed as and when required.

A copy of this Notice, with a copy of your Bid, including all terms and conditions, is being
forwarded to ali Using Agencies.

Thank you for your interest in doing business with Broward County.
Sincerely,

GLENN R. CUMMINGS, Director
Purchasing Division

by e, Quecn

Liz Overton
Purchasing Agent PATI

BIVLETTER 2/spg
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SUBMIT BID TO!

Broward County Purchasing Division
115 S. Andrews Avenus, Room 212
Fort Lauderdale, F®rida 33301-1801

BOARD OF GOUNTY COMMISSIONERS
BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA

INVITATION FOR BID

Bidder Acknowledgment

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS. THE 80ARD O
MODIFY ANY OF THESE STANDARD INSTRUCTIO
N THE SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS TG BIDDERS ORIN'T

SHALL PREVAIL OVER ANY CONFLICTING PROVI
REGARDLESS OF A

SION
NY LANGUAGE '™ BIDDER'S CONT

SEALED BIDS: This form must be exacuted and submitted
with 2!l bid sheets in a sealed envelape, {00 NOT INCLUDE

— GENERAL CONDITIONS —
THESE INSTRUCTIONS ARE STANDARD FOR ALL CONTRACTS F

NS FOR A PARTICULAR CONTRACT BY INDICATING SUGH CHANGE
ISSUED BY THE COUNTY, BIDDER AGREES THAT THE PROVI

OR COMMODITIES/SERVICES ISSUED BY THE
F COUNTY COMMISSIONERS MAY DELETE, SUPERSEDE OR

HT BID SHEETS. BY ACCEPTANCE OF A PURCHASE ORDER
SIONS INCLUDED WITHIN THIS INVITATION FOR BID
WITHIN ANY STANDARD FORM CONTRACT OF THE BIDDER
RACT TQ THE CONTRARY,

BIDS WILL BE OFENED 2 pum, [P ST A

and may no* be witndrawn within 50 ca'endar daye after sueh date and time.

WORE THAN ONE BID PER ENVELOPE). The face of the
envelope shal! cortain the above address, the dale and the time
of bid opeming. and bid number. Bids not submitted on atached
pic forrm may be rejected. All bids ara subjected to the conditians
specified herain, Those which do not comply with these condi-
tions are subjsct to rejaciion.

BIC TITLE N
TES,
13

Tiif
C-0r

£
COMT R

ST

1. EXECUTION OF BID: Bid must contain an original signature

EIDND
EReBEas6t

of an individual authorized lo bind the bidder. Big must be
typed or printedinink. All corrections mada by bidder ta his hid
must alse be inilialled. The viddar's name should alsoappaar -

PUACHASING AGENT NAME & TELEPHONE NUMSER

L T T (FE4) HET-ANT

on each page o 1he bid sheet if required. Bids will not be
accepted frorm firms in arrears o the Board of County Comemis-
sioners upon debt or contract nor from a defaulter upon

DELIVERY DATE

gt E Bre Al TRy

cbligations to the Board of County Commissioners. Bidder
certifies by signing the bid thal ro principals or corporate

CASH DISSOUNT TERMS

officars of his firm were principals of corporate officers in any
other firm which may have been suspended of debarrad from
doing business with Broward County within the lasl three
years, unless so noted in the tid documants.

NG BID: I nel sunmitting a bid, respond by returning this

BID GUARANTY IS ATTACHED.
WHEN REQUIRED, IN
THE AMOQUNT OF

REASOM FOR NO BID

Bidder Acknowledgement form, masking it "NO BID”, no later
than the stated bid opening date and hour, and explain the
reasen in the space provided. Failure to respaond without

FCDERAL EMPLOYER I.D. or SOCIAL SECURITY NUMBER

£5-0085242

justification may be cause ior removal of the bidder's name
from the bid mailing list. NOTE: To gualify as @ respondant,
bidder must submit a “NO BID."

DUN & E3ADSTREET NUMEBER

 BID WITHDRAWAL: No bidder may withdraw his bid before
the expiration of ninety {90} calendgar days from the date of bid
opaning unless vendor so notes in the bid.

_BID OPENING: Shab be public, on date, locaian and time
specified on the bid form. 1 is the bidder's rasponsibilily to
assure that his bid i3 delivered on date, lacalion and time
specified onthe bid form, Bids, whichforany reasonare notsa
delvered, will ast ke considered. Bid files and any bids after
they are apened may be examined dusing nammai warking
rours by appeintment. Bid labulations are availablg forinspec-
tion upGon reguast.

 ADDENDA TC BID: Broward Couniy reserves the right to
amend this Bid grior to the Bid cpening dale indicatad. Only
wiitten addenda will be binding. If, upon review, materialerrors
in specifications are faund, conlact the Purchasing Division
immediately, prior to Bid opening date, to allow far review and
subsequent clarification on the part of Broward County.

{Countinued on Page 2)

BIDDER MNAME

Florida Superior Sand, Inc.
BIDDER MAILING ANDRESS CITYISTATEZIR
1489 W. Palmetto Park Road;
Bocz Raton, Fl. 23486

ARTA CODE TELEPHDNE MO,
(561)391 g

CONTACT PERSON
Andrew Arenc

I’ AORIZED STGNATURE {originai in ink)
Ahdrew Arena V.P.
TYPED NAME OF SIGNEA TITLE

| cest; thar this bud I5 mMade wioul pricr undersianding. agreemani, of LeErrechern Wt
carpstatan, firmoar perscn jubmitng a bid far the same ilems/services, and is in al respe
wilbeu! calusion ar fraud, | agres 1o abide by al conditiens ol 1nis bid and certity thatlam
10 55r mis bie for the biddar. Furthar by sigratue of thig ferm, pages 1 through 4 are acknee
and arrepled as weli 33 any specia Mstrucicn sheat(s) if appheabie.

art

=IEET

ettt

Form k103-28 (Rev. 1:22) page
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BID} SHEET © BID#E-D-98:282.G+1
(CONTINUED)

AGGREGATES. TQP DRESSINGS AND
. SAND, CO-OPERATIVE CONTRACT (REBID)
Ry.i
£ 7one THREE - COMMERCIAL BOULEVARD SouTH 1O INcLUDE GRIFFIN RoAD, FLORIDA TURNPIKE WEST 70 Us 27,
Szr ATTACHMENT “B”. ESTIMATED QUANTITIES INCLUDE REQUIREMENTS FOR BROWARD COUNTY,
Davie, PLANTATION AND SUNRISE.

GROUP 3B (ITEMS 44 THRU 50)

ESTIMATED
ITEM ANNUAL COMMODITY CODE DELIVERED
NO. QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL
#790700020030
44, 50 Top Dressing Mix 90/10 As PER ATTACHMENT "A”
CU.YD SPECIFICATIONS $_.22.50 fouyyp $1.125.20
#790700300030
45, 80 Topr DressiNG Mix 80/20 AS PER ATTACHMENT “A” )
cu.¥D SPECIFICATIONS $_25.24 _jeuvwp $2.075.20
#790700070030
48, 100 Top DrREsSING 70/30 - STERILIZED AS PER _
CU.YD ATTACHMENT “A" SPECIFICATIONS §_21.88  feuvyp $Z.1E88.00
#790700500030
AT, 300 Tor DRESSING Mix 100% AS PER ATTACHMENT "A” -
CU.YD SPECIFICATIONS $_15.53 jouwvp $4.685.00
#150120030030
43. 80 ORTONA SAND AS PER ATTACHMENT "A” . ~
cu.YD SPECIFICATIONS 5_15.63 fouvp $1.25C-20
#790700080030
43. 20 Top DRESSING MATERIAL FLORIDA LAWN SEED R ~
CUXD AS PER ATTAGHMENT “A” SPEGIFICATIONS $_10.62 jouvyp $212:60
#150120020030
50. 280 MASON SAND AS PER ATTACHMENT “A” )
TONS SPECIFICATIONS §__92.50 fron $£.£60.00_

TOTAL GROUP 3B
(ITEMS 44 THRU 50)

DELIVERY WILL BE _ 2 CALENDAR DAYS AFTER RECEIPT OF PurcHASE ORDER.

NAMEOFBIDDER _Floridzs Superiozr ESand, Tog.

NOTE I0 PROSPECTIVE BIDDER:
BE SURE TO HAVE THE INVITATION FOR BID, [BIDDER ACKNOWLEDGMENT (BLUE} FORM] SIGNED BY AN AUTHORIZED
REFRESENTATIVE OF YCUR FIRM OR YOUR BID WILL NOT BE CONSIDERED RESPONSIVE.

ATDS-91B
27299 Page 18 oF 35



BID SHEET BID #E-0:08-283:G-1

{CONTINUED)
* AGGREGATES. TOP DRESSINGS AND
SAND, CO-QPERATIVE CONTRACT (REBID)
ZONE Six - GSRIFEIN ROAD SouTH TO DADE CounTy LINE. FLORIDA TURNPIKE EasT 10 STATE RoaDp A1A, SEE

ATTACHMENT “B”. EsTiMATED QUANTITIES INCLUDE REQUIREMENTS FOR BROWARD GOUNTY,
HolLLywoopn, HALLANDALE, AND MIRAMAR.

GROUP 6C (ITEMS 105 THRU 108}

ESTIMATED
ITEM ANNUAL COMMODITY CCDE DELIVERED
NO. QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICGE TOTAL
#790700040060
105. 100 Top DressING Mix 80/20 STERILIZED AS PER
CU.YD ATTACHMENT “A” SPEGIFICATIONS $_25.94 jeu.yp $.2,594.00
#790700070060
106. 20 Top DressING 70/30-STERILIZED AS PER
CU.YD ATTAGHMENT “A" SPECIFICATIONS 5_21.88 jeuvp $.437-80
#790700020060 -
107. 25 NURSERY MIX-STERILIZED AS PER ATTACHMENT “A”
cL.YD SPECIFICATIONS 5 . Jouxo g(no bid)
#790700100060
108. 20 ExoTic Mix-STERILIZED AS PER ATTACHMENT *A” _
CU.¥D SPECIFICATIONS $_ Jocuvp glno bid)
TOTAL GROUP 6C
(ITEMS 105 THRU 108) §2,031.60
GRAND TOTAL (ITEMS 1-108) $-181,810.4C

WILL OFFER AN ADDITIONAL

%, OFF EACH DELIVERED PRICE IF ALL ITEMS
{ENTER COMPANY NAME)

(1-108) ARE AWARDED TO OUR COMPANY. gn/e
ghBl 510.40

CHLEr S A
e

ToTaL AFTER DISCOUNT

DELIVERY WiILL BE Z CALENDAR DAYS AFTER RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER.

PIT LOCATION (s)
Florida FRock Tndustries, Inc. gritona, Florida
T.R. Jahnza Industries, In<. Ortonz, Florida

NAME OF BIDDER Fiorida Supsriocr Sand, Inc.

BE SURE TO HAVE THE INV!TATIbN FOR BID, [BIDDERACKNOWLEDGMENT(BLUEJ FORM] SIGNED BY AN AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OF YOUR FIRM OR YOUR BID WILLNOT BE CONSIDERED RESPONSIVE.

ATDS-91B
12/17/98 pace 26 0F 35



BR

Purchasing Division
115 8. Andrews Avenue, Room 212

: s Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301
ARD COUNTY (954) 357-0065 = FAX (954) 357-5535
May 5, 1999

#522065619 0
Tenex Enterprises
7837 West Sample Rd., Ste #1035

Coral Springs, FL 33065

Att: Hamid Foxladi, Vice President

REFERENCE: BID #ED98283G1 for Aggregates, Top Dressing and Sand, Co-Op Contract
(REBID) for Items Groups 1C, 2C, 3C, 4C, 5B&C, 6B&C

Gentlemen:

This is to confirm that the Board of County Commissioners at its Meeting held on Apnil 27, 1999
under Agenda Iten No. 15 accepted your Bid on the above-referenced solicitation.

A Bid tabulation of all Bids received is enclosed, with item(s) awarded to your firm underlined.

The Contract is in effect for the period beginning April 27, 1999 and ending April 26, 2000.
Purchase Order(s) will be placed as and when required.

A copy of this Notice, with a copy of your Bid, including all terms and conditions, is being
forwarded to all Using Agencies.

Thank you for your interest in doing business with Broward County.
Sincerely,

GLENN R. CUMMINGS, Director
Furchasing Division

oy T Qe

L{z Overton
Purchasing Agent PA II

BID/LETTER 2/spg

BROWARD COUNTY BOARD OF CQUNTY COMMISSIONERS — An Equal Opportunity Employer and Pravidar of Sarvices

Morran Apremowit; Saott | Cowan Suzonne N Guezourger Krisnn ©. #accbs leme Ueberman Lo Nonee Parisn John B Roasism, Jr.

World Wide Weh: hitp://www.co.broward.t.us/purchasing



. =

EOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
J G:
SUBMIT BID T BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA
Broward County Purchasing Division

115 . Andraws Avenue, Room 212 ‘NV‘TAT‘ON FOR BID

Fort Lauderdale, Flgida 33301-1801 )
Bidder Acknowladgment

— GENERAL CONDITIONS -——
THESE INSTRUGTIONS ARE STANDARD FOR ALL COMTRACTS FOR COMMODITIES/SERVICES 1SSUED BY THZ
EOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS, THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMIISSIONERS MAY DELETE, SUPERSEDEOR
FADDIEY ANY OF THESE STANDARD INSTRUCTIONS FOR A PARTICULAR CONTRACT BY INDICATING SUCH CHANGE
1N THE SPECIAL INSTHR! CTIONS TO BIDDERS OR IN THE BID SHZETS. BY ACCEPTAMCE OF A PURCHASE ORODER
1SSUED BY THE COUNTY, B.DDER AGREES THAT THE PAROVISIONS INCLUDED WITRIN THIS INVITATION FOR BID
cHALL PARZVAL OVER ANY CONFLICTING PROVISION WITHIN ANY STANDARD FORM CONTRACT OF THE BIDDER
RZGARDLESS OF ANY LANGUASE N BIDDER'S CONTRACT TOTHE COMTRARY.

nhi

SEALED BIDS: This form must ke sxecuted and submittad B0SWILLBE OFENED 2R ™ (e
with all bid sheets in a sealed envelope. (DQ NQOT INCLUDE 2nd may na: be wihdrawn witre 53 calencar days aher sech
MORE THAN ONE BID FER ENVELOPE), Tha face of the
envalope shall contain tha above addrass, the daiz andthe time
of bid ooening. and bid rumicer. Bids not submitted on attached
bic forn may be rejectec. Al bids are subjecled to the condiions
specified harain Those which do not compty with thase coadi-
tions are subject lo rajeelisn.

daig and lime,

g TIT.E

[ERELE:
TRAEST

CPES, TOP DRESE
Wk, Cae-0F © [

BID NO.

4 EXECUTION OF BID: Bid must contain an original signature FreBaB3G]
ot an individual awhorized to bind the hiddzr. Bid must be PURCHEGNG AGENT NakIZ & TELEPHONE NUMBZR
typed orpr\:‘.ledmi."'f.,Allco:recticnsmadebybiddertehtsbid T (T Citd
mus. also beinmaled. The bidder's name should a'so appear bode MYED LA
or each page of tha bid shest il required. Bids will not be -| mELVERY DATE
ancepiad fromfirmsin arrearsiothe BoardofCounty Commis-
sioners upon dzbt or contract nof fram a defaulter upon
obligatiors 1o the Beoard of County COMMISSIGABIS. Bidder
cemiies by signing the bid that no principals ar corperaie

SR E YRR AR
CAGH DiSCOUNT TERMS

offizers of his firmware principais or corporate oificers inany B10 GUARANTY 15 ATTACHED,
cther firen which may have been suspendedor debared fzom WHEN SZ0UIRED, IN
daing business with Broward County witnin the fast tneee THE AMOUNT OF E

yoers. unless so nated in the bid dogurments.

EEASQN FOR MO BID
2. NO BID: 1 not submiting 2 big. respond by returning this
Bidder Acknowladgsment form, marking it "NO BID", no later

thar the stated bid opening date and hour, and explein the | TEO5F LEMPLOYER D, ¢ BOCIAL SECURITY RUMB=:
. ' : . . [ - LR
resson in the space providad. Failurz to raspond without E GHRELE O

justification may be causa jor remaval of ne biddar's name
tror tno bid mating st NOTE: To gquaify as 2 respondent,
bidder must submit a "NO BID "

DU & STADSTREET HUMEEZR

BIDDES MAME
3. BID WITHDRAWAL: No bidder may withdrasw s bid before - FRTERPRIGES T
tre sxgicationof ninety {90} calendar days from the datzofic - ENTERPRIGES . AD
cpening unless vendor 80 nedas in the bid BIDOIA MAILING ADDRESICITYSTATEZIR

G PLE

4 B0 OPEMING: Shall be pubiic. o3 date, location and time

spgsifisd on the bid form I is the bicder's respansioiiy 12
aszure thal his hid is delivared on dalg, jocztion and tims
502 dcn!hebidfcrm.Bids.which.'oran-;reasonarenotsa

deliverad, will not be cansidered. Bid figs and any bids afer
they &re cpened may ke examined duing pormal worming
hours oy appointment. Bid tabulations are availadle forinspac-
tiar Upoh requEst

=
TSRO LIy i It L

& ADDENDA TO BID: Broward Counly reserves the rgnt to
amend this Bid prior to the Bid opening dats indicated. Only
written addenda will be binding. 1f, upon revia, materialerrars
in specificalions are found, contact tne Purchasing Drisian
immadiately, picr to Bid opening date, toakiow far review ard
supeanuent cigrification on the part of Broward County.

= wilheut gricr urdersiandng. 2
ting 4 b 137 Fe same HELAST
ra g abica 2y 2l congitions ol s
ature ol Wis fom, p
uctian sheat(s) il azphcatia.

g5, ardisinal
@ and cenfy rat
25 1 Trough & 212 acknew 2557

(Countnued on Page 2) z
szapied 45 well @5 any special ins?

For #103-23 (Rav. 1163 page 1 ol 4



BiD #E-D:48:232:G:1
(CONTINUED)

Mﬁngmmmwﬂ@

o [ 4

o COMMERCIAL BOULEVARD SOUTH TO INCGLUBE Grirriy RoaD. FLORIDA TurNEIKE WesT To Us 27.
2 Sez ATTACHMENT “B. EsTIMATED QUANTITIES [kCLUDE REQUIREMENTS FOR BrowarD COUNTY,
DaVIE, PLANTATION AND SUNRISE-

GROUP 3C (ITEMS 51 THRU 54) TOP DRESSING - STERILIZED

ESTIMATED
ITEM ANNUAL cOMMODITY CODE DELIVERED
NO. QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL
#790700040030
51. 300 Tor DrESSING MiX £0/20 STERILIZED AS PER -
cu.YD ATTACHMENT “A” SPECIFICATIONS $__¢LC_:{—JCU.YD § 7 ‘(’Lﬁ ¢
#790700060030 g
52. 20 Top DrESsMG MIX 70720 AS PER ATTACHMENT “A" L/ )
cu.YD SPECIFICATIONS $ 9_3 jcuwd § O
#790700090030
53. 80 NuRSERY MIx-STERILIZED AS PER ATTACHMENT "A’ T 0
CU.YD SPECIFICATIONS $_—;J:i—/CU.YD S j CT A~
#760700100030
54. 20 Ex0TIC MIX-STERILIZED AS pER ATTACHMENT “A” 9_ 6{ j 8 S
CU.YD SPECIFICATIONS 3 Jocuyp ST ——

TOTAL GROUP 3C s\@ﬂ 6 c

(ITEMS 51 THRU 54)

DELIVERY WILL BE __9:__ CALENDAR DAYS AFTER RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER.

-._._;—-"-4
NAMEOFBIDDER_LE_Q—_O(—_EM C .

BE SURE TOHAVE THE INVITATIbN FOR BID, [BIDDER ACKNOWLEDGMENT(BLUE) FORM] SIGNED BY AN AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OF YOUR FIRM OR YOUR BID WILL NOT BE CONSIDERED RESPONSIVE.

ATDS-91B -
12/117/88 PAGETTC



BID #F-R-93-283-G-1

(COHTIHUED)
. M - )
GriFr RoaD SOUTHTO DaDE COUNTY LINE- FLoRIDA TURNPIKE EasT 10 STATE ROAD A1A., SEE
<TACHMENT “B”. ESTIMATED QUANTITIES INCLUDE REQUIREMENTS FOR BROWARD COUNTY,

HoLLYWOOD, HALLANDALE, AND IMiRAMAR.

GROUP 6C (ITEMS 105 THRU 108)

ESTIMATED
ITEM ANNUAL COMMODITY CODE DELIVERED
NO. QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL
#790?00040060 :
105. 100 Toe DressinG Mix 80720 STERILIZED AS PER e
cy.Yo ATTACHMENT LAY GPECIFICATIONS S_’C’f‘—fg“ cuxyD S ;LC{ o
#790700070060
108. 20 Top DRESSING 70/30-STERILIZED AS PER ; .
cu.YD ATTACHMENT “A7 SPECIFICATIONS $__9_—__§_—/CU.YD S Z{ é ©
#790700090060 ,
107. 25 NURSERY Mix-STERILIZED AS pER ATTACHMENT A" 1o
cu.YD SPECIFICATIONS . $___21g——fcu.*m $_____Q_—-
‘ #790700100060
108. 20 ExoTIC Mix-STERILIZED AS pER ATTACHMENT AT CL)
cu.YD SPECIFICATIONS 5____(LJCU.YD $ 8 i
TOTAL GROUP 6C : 4 o /,'/
(ITEMS 105 THRU 108) gt
- _ GRAND TOTAL (ITEMS 1-108) s2393=
TE A E 7L & 2550 20
/ € t: o -//VSM OFEER AN ADDITIONAL " %4 OFF EACH DELIVERED PRIGE IF A'LL??TEMS 00
(ENTER COMPANY NAME) ' &
(1-108) ARE AWARDED TO OUR COMPANY. R T — =5
334 35
ToTAL AFTER DISCOUNT S
=,
DELIVERY WILL BE _L CALENDAR DAYS AFTER REGEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER. 4—3 5J0308
PIT LOCATION {s} .- —_ . (—
Qo kE T peden. oA IE iy R F
iptwed o ——— \oeo AL NS \»f&.y«e_f_\.g\{!@t-ii
NAME OF BIDDER [EEA T 4 C. .
BE SURE TO HAVE THE INVITATION FOR BID, [BIDDER ACKNOWLEDGMENT(BLUE) FORM] SIGNED BY AN AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OF YOUR FIRM OR YOUR BID WILL NOT BE CONSIDERED RESPONSIVE.
ATDS-91B e
147/98 PacE 28



Purchasing Division
115 S, Andrews Avenue, Room 212
i~ Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301
UNTY (954) 357-5065 + FAX (§54) 357-8535

May 5, 1999

#650217634 0

L.B. Trucking & Construction
4891 NW 103rd Avenue, Ste#11
Sunrise, FL 33351

Att: Alexander Bucknor, President
REFERENCE: BID #ED98283G1 for Aggregates, Top Dressing and Sand, Co-Op Contract
(REBID) for Items Groups lA&B, ZA, 3A, 4A&B

Gentlemen:

This 1s to confirm that the Board of County Commissioners at its Meeting held on April 27, 1999
under Agenda Tten No. 15 accepted your Bid on the above-referenced solicilation.

A Bid tabulation of all Bids received is enclosed, with item(s) awarded to your firm underlined.

The Contract is in effect for the period beginning April 27, 1999 and ending April 26, 2000.
Purchase Order(s) will be placed as and when required.

A copy of this Notice, with a copy of yeur Bid, including all terms and conditions, is being
forwarded to all Using Agencies.

Thank you for your interest in doing business with Broward County.
Sincerely,

GLENN R, CUMMINGS, Director
Purchasing Ihvision

By% @U‘FA}O\\—/

Lik Overton
Purchasing Agent PA II

BID/LETTER 2/spg

BROWARD COUNTY BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS — An Equal Opportunity Ermplayer cnd Provider of Sarvices

Narmon ADrarmowiz Scolt 1. Cowan  Suzanne N. Guninuger Kir.n D Jocobs flens Liebermen Lo Monce Parsn John E. Rocstrom. 7

World Wide Wsk: th;waw.CO.browc:rd.fI.Usfpurchcsing



ACTION: R SCREEN: VEN? USER
CREEN. ERID: PID8 03/17/59
82 09:24:03 AM
2 — : .

VENDOR (1 OF 2)

v VENDOR= 650217634 0
ENDOR TYPE: B MISC VENDOR IND: N

- LAST ACTION DATH: 11 09 98
——————— VENDOR ADDRESS ------- ~
NAME: L.B. TRUCKING & DOMESS “=="===  =-==- ALTERNATE ADDRESS ------
ADDRESS: 4891 N.W. 103 AvggggTRUCTION ; ;ﬁx# 954-748-1753
. SUIT WS
ZIP: 33351 TE: FL o REEPER. Hbq-i&ES
S ao. MEREDAY  MARMoos, CUSTOMER ACCT:
" PHONE: s =AEHOR A/R CONTACT:

COMMENT :

5g—man.gagg
| ASU-S92-779 9
PYMT HOLD IND: N SCHD DYMT DAY

SINGLE CHECK: N EFT STATUS/TYPE: N /

)
CA??E%KE gr’;‘g ii?]ré‘ 0.00 PRIOR CALENDAR YEAR AMT: 0.00
: 0.00 PRIOR FISCAL YEAR AMT: 0-00

3‘#8{9? - IZT A ettt
356 oo

MERRDAD S

s [ I onn—

doing business with Broward County within the last three ™ | THE AMUUNTGF i
years, unless so noted in the bid documents,

REASCN FOR NO BID

2. NO BID: !f mot submitting a bid, respand by returning this )
Bidder Acknowladgement form, marking it “NO BIiD", no later
than the stated bic opening date and hour, and explain the | FEDERAL EMPLOYER LD, or SOCIAL SECURITY NUMBER
reason in the space provided Failure to respond without 6500 17 é ) L{ e}
justification may be cause for removal of the bidder's name TN & BRADSTREET NUMBER
from the bid mailing list. NOTE: To qualify as a respondent, :
bidder must submit a "NO BiD."

BIDDER NAME . ; - ;
3. BID WiTHDRAWAL: No bidder may withdraw his bid bafore -
the expiration of ninety (90) calendar days from the date of bid L.B. TR 0C k 7/‘/6' oL COm ST Ruv L, j:o,—\f

cpening unless vendor se notes in the bid. BIDDER MAILING ADDRESS/CITY/STATEZIP

4, BID OPENING: Shall be public, on date, Iocation and lime
specified on the bid form. 1t is the bidder's responsibility to
assure that his bid is delivered on date, location and time
specified on the bidform, Bids, whichforany reasonare notso AREA CODE TELEFHONE MO, CONTACT PERSON
delivered, will not be considered. Bid files and any hids after
they are openad may be examined during normal working
hours by appointment. Bid labulations are available forinspec-

tion upen request. i?@ g z.@ M L
/s -

5. ADDENDA TO BID: Broward County reserves the right 1o AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE (original in ink) .
amend this Bid prior 1o the Bid opsning date indicated. Only o : e
N written addenda will be binding. If, upon review, material errors ALERANDER 3 v (kND R P}QG S'J:‘DG"/ i

in specifications are found, contact the Purchasing Division - Tric
immediately, priot to Bid opening date, o allow for review and TYPED NAME OF SIGNER cop TIMLE L

ficati " | oty that this bid is made without prigr understanding, agreernent, of gonnecton with z~¥

SUbsequem clanf:cauo_n on the par‘! of Bro Nérd COUI'.‘It.y. cur;:or;hoﬂ, firm or person submiting a b;zl ot tha sama items/services, _and isinall respects fair anc

v . without caliusion or fraud. | agree to abide by all conditions of this bid and cartity that | am authorized

{Countinued on Page 2} : to sign this bid lor the bidder. Further by sigriature ol this form, pages { lhrough 4 are acknowladged
) and accepted as well as any special 'mslrucuon_sr_\eet(s) it sppii?ahie. D i .

Form #103-28 {Rev. 1/33} a7 -Page1of4




’ oNE THREE *

SEE ATTACHMENT “B

BiD SHEET
(CONTlNUED)

BID #E:D-02-283-G=1

AGELREGAIES.IQEQBESSJNGS_AMD
SAND, CO-OPERATIVE CONTRACT (REBID)

L 3
COMMERCIAL BOULEVARD SOUTHTO IncLuUpE GRIFFIN RoAD. FLORIDA TURNP
EsTiMATED QUANTITIES INcLUDE REQUIREMENTS FOR

DavVIE, PLANTATION AND SUNRISE.

GROUP 3A (ITEMS 37 THRU 43)

KE WesT To Us 27.
BrowaRD COUNTY,

ESTIMATED
ITEM ANNUAL COMMODITY CODE DELIVERED
NO. QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE PERTON TOTAL
5 #750667000030
37. 26,768 RoaD Rock - GRUSHED Livie RocK As PER
TONS ATTACHMENT “A” SPECIFICATIONS $_M—JTDN SBM- Y
#750667010030
38. 10,432 THREE-QUARTER INCH WasH Rock As PER o/ .gé 5
TONS ATTACHMENT “A” SPECIFICATIONS $’i-' _E‘_JTON __1{1—43_‘.'
2 :
750074000130 Uy é { %1/ (O' 2.
39. 25,000 FiLL AS PER ATTACHMENT “A” SPECIFICATIONS g S 2 fToN s__@ﬂa_ﬁol,b
TONS
#750075000030
40. 10,000 STABILIZER MATERIAL As PER ATTACHMENT ‘A"
TONS SPECIFICATIONS S__':L"_é_‘Z/TON $_ﬁ£,z_‘599‘f
A 6 %750773000030
1. 1,160 ONCRETE SCREENINGS AS PER ATTACHMENT AT
TONS SPECIFICATIONS 5_2;l_l——fTON $___‘_?_Li€-.7—' é
#750667020030 A N
42. 1,400 CRruUsHED LIMEROCK 70% as PER ATTACHMENT “Ar
TONS SPECIFICATIONS % 5. 1 /TON $___7.Ll‘5:3—‘ :
750667040030
43, 20 Pea ROCK AS PER ATTACHMENT “A” SEECIFICATIONS $_7_‘_LL—ITON $___LL"£"_Z
TONS

NAME OF BIDDER b= A TR CELTING X

BESURETO
REPRESENTA

TOTAL GROUP 3A
(ITEMS 37 THRU 43)

DELIVERY WiLL BE l CALENDAR DAYS AETER RECEWT oF PURGHASE QORDER.

ATDS-818

42/17/98

o §T RICT T o TN

s 21 ¢
#’5%7}201,
4

HAVE THE INVITAT!bN FOR BID, [BIDDER ACKNOWLEDGMENT(BLUE) FORM] SIGNED BY AN AUTHORIZED
TIVE OF YOUR FIRM OR YOUR BID WiLL NOTBE CONSIDERED RESPONSIVE.

paGE150F <




BiD SHEET BID #E-D-98-283-G-1
{CONTINUED}

AGGREGATES. TOP DRESSINGS AND
- SAND, CO-OPERATIVE CONTRACT (REBID)

ZoNe Six-  GRIFFIN ROAD SOUTH To DADE CouNTy Line. FLORIDA TURNPIKE EAST TO STATE RoaDp A1A. See
ATTACRMENT “B”. ESTIMATEC QuanTiTiES INCLUDE REQUIREMENTS FOR BROWARD COUNTY,
HoLLywooDn, HALLANBALE, ANG MIRAMAR.

GROUP 6C (ITEMS 105 THRU 108}

ESTIMATED
ITEM ANNUAL COMMODITY CODE DELIVERED
NO. QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL
#790700040060
105. 100 Tor DRESsING Mix B0/20 STERILIZED AS PER
CU.YD ATTACHMENT “A” SPECIFICATIONS S—MB'—/CU-YD S
#790700070060
106. 20 Tor Dressing 70/30-STERILIZED AS FER
cuxYD ATTACHMENT “A” SPECIFICATIONS $_ﬂ’L‘,B__/CLJ.YD —_
#790700090080
107. 25 NURSERY MIX-STERILIZED AS PER ATTACHMENT “A” S
Cu.YD SPECIFICATIONS 3 N ) cu.yn §
#790700100060
108. 20 ExoTic MIX-STERILIZED AS PER ATTACHMENT “A”

cu.YD SPECIFICATIONS _ $_"Q&_}cu_m R

TOTAL GROUP 6C

(ITEMS 105 THRU 108) s

GRAND TOTAL (ITEMS 1-108) s
WILL OFFER AN ADDITIONAL % OFF EAGH DELIVERED PRICE IF ALL ITEMS
(ENTER COMPANY NAME) .
(1-108) ARE AWARDED TO OUR COMPANY. § O
TOTAL AFTER DISCOUNT 32,968, 07
DELIVERY WILL BE | CaLENDAR DAYS AFTER RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER. 4 3/ 33 LIZJ }ﬁ 3.
PIT LOCATION (s) R
Lo &cbych Sand fums, Lo W RoT 2o MIRAMAR
RENKEA MM TFaMmT Sup SHINE  pFamFE

NAME OF BIDDER _ L= (2 TRu kTl X (o ST R VET Tad  Fpl -
NOTE 70 PROSPECTIVE BIDDER:

BE SURE TO HAVE THE INVITATION FOR BID, [BIDDER ACKNOWLEDGMENT (BLUE} FORM] SIGNED BY AN AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OF YOUR FIRM OR YOUR BID WILL NOT BE CONSIDERED RESPONSIVE.

ATDS-91B

12/17/98 PAGE 26 OF 33



